
BID TABULATION

KITCHEN COMMERCIAL SANITIZERS

ITB: 66-20

JOY MCDOWELL

Item Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

1

Food Processing Surface Sanitizers                                   

Kills human Coronavirus and Hepatitis A in 60 seconds; kills 

99% of germs on surfaces; eliminates Listeria, Salmonella, 

E. coli and Norovirus in 30 seconds; NSF D2 registered; 

requires no rinse; sanitizes gloves and footwear in 10 

seconds; helps remove food allergens on hard, non-porous 

surfaces; formulated with approved EPA ingredients for 

Food Contact Sanitizing Solutions, recognized as GRAS 

Direct Food Substances by the FDA.

35 CASE $40.69 NO BID

Item Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

2

Food Processing Surface Sanitizers                                

Kills human Coronavirus and Hepatitis A in 60 seconds; kills 

99% of germs on surfaces; eliminates Listeria, Salmonella, 

E. coli and Norovirus in 30 seconds; NSF D2 registered; 

requires no rinse; sanitizes gloves and footwear in 10 

seconds; helps remove food allergens on hard, non-porous 

surfaces; formulated with approved EPA ingredients for 

Food Contact Sanitizing Solutions, recognized as GRAS 

Direct Food Substances by the FDA. (50 GALLON 

DRUM)                                                                                                                                             

20 DRUM $625.92 $15, 337.60

Manufacturer

Number of gallons per drum

Product Number 3905500 ESS-2331-55

Ext. Total

12/32 oz.

BETCO

3901200

Essential Industries

4/1 gallons 

ESS-2331-1

Number and size per case

Manufacturer

Product Number

34810-35-4170 13324-63-3838 N/A

Ext. Total Unit Price Ext. Total

N/A

N/A

EPA Product Number

$12, 518.40 $870.00 $17, 400.00 $766.88

84368-1-84150

55 gallon 55 gallons

BETCO

$1, 424.15 $69.00

Unit Price Ext. Total

10324-63-383834810-35-4170

Essential Industries

mcdowellj@jccal.org

Ext. Total

3. Central Paper 

Company

NO BID

50 gallons

Purell

5047-01

N/A

EPA Product Number

2. Green Vision and 

Associates LLC
1. Turner Supply 

Ext. Total

$2,415.00
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Item Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

3

Foodservice Surface Sanitizer                                         

Kills human Coronavirus and Hepatitis A in 60 seconds; 

eliminated Norovirus, Salmonella, E. coli and Listeria in 30 

seconds; no handwashing required after use; kosher pareve; 

proven effective across most hard and soft surfaces. 

40 CASE $40.69 NO BID

Item Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price

4

Germicidal Spray Cleaner                                       

Colorless, lemon-scented with a pH range of 11.5-12.0; 

RTU; prevents cross contamination.

40 CASE $40. 69 $1,920.00 

EEOC Statement

Affidavit of Contractor/E-Verify

Signature Page

Debarment Statement

Price Sheet

Statement of Compliance

$17, 197.75

BETCO Essential Industries

3901200 ESS-2331-1

Product Number

Ext. Total Unit Price Ext. Total

12/32 oz. 6 Case/QuartsNumber and size per case

$17, 257.10
Delivery is guaranteed no later than ________ days after order date. 7 10 45-60 

12 x 32 oz.

Midlab

042000-12

$ 23, 907.00

YES

Notification Of Intent To Respond

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Ext. Total Unit Price Ext. Total Ext. Total

$1, 627.60 $69.00 $2, 760.00

12/32 oz. 4/1 gallon

1. Turner Supply 
2. Green Vision and 

Associates LLC

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

BETCO Essential Industries

3901200 ESS-733-Quart

YES

YES

$1, 627.60 $33.30 $1,332.00

NO BID

$48.00

3. Central Paper 

Company

N/A

N/A

N/A

3. Central Paper Corp./140 West Oxmoor Road/Homewood, AL 35209/Erick Petterson/205-942-6333/epetterson@centralpaper-al.com

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YESYES

2. Green Visions and Associates LLC/2300 Gerald Jean Street/ Gadsden, AL 35901/Lorice Jackson/205-243-0123/iicor57jackson@hotmail.com

1. Turner Supply/401 33rd Street W/Birmingham, AL 35222/Chip Schramm/205-252-6000/cschramm@turnersupply.com

CONTACTS:

Number and size per case

Manufacturer

Product Number

EPA Product Number N/A10324-63-383834810-35-4170

EPA Product Number 10324-85-383834810-35-4170 1839-83-45745

PACA Coversheet YES YES YES

YES

YES

Ext. Total

Required Forms

GRAND TOTAL ITEMS 1-4

Manufacturer
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